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GROUP 1, MJ BEND
4ea. (SAWS #9628) UNIT
Bend, size 4" x 1/4, end type mechanical joint, PRICE 22.37 22.56 25.05 29.00 25.20 27.75
1. degree 90, material ductile iron TOTAL 89.48 90.24 100.20 116.00 100.80 111.00
4ea.  (SAWS #9629) UNIT
Bend, size 4" x 1/8, end type mechanical joint, PRICE 18.44 18.60 20.66 23.92 21.30 22.87
2. degree 45, material ductile iron TOTAL 73.76 74.40 82.64 95.68 85.20 91.48
2ea. (SAWS #9626) UNIT
Bend, size 4" x 1/16, end type mechanical joint PRICE 17.53 17.68 19.54 22.73 20.50 21.75
3. degree 22-1/2, material ductile iron TOTAL 35.06 35.36 39.08 45.46 41.00 43.50
2ea. (SAWS #9627) UNIT
Bend, size 4" x 1/32, end type mechanical joint PRICE 16.63 16.77 18.53 21.56 19.20 20.62
4. degree 11-1/4, material ductile iron TOTAL 33.26 33.54 37.06 43.12 38.40 41.24
lea. (SAWS #9632) UNIT
Bend, size 6" x 1/4, end type mechanical joint PRICE 36.57 37.42 40.76 47.43 41.53 45.37
5. degree 90, material ductile iron TOTAL 36.57 37.42 40.76 47.43 41.53 45.37
10ea. (SAWS #9633) UNIT
Bend, size 6" x 1/8, end type mechanical joint PRICE 29.62 30.31 33.53 38.41 33.50 36.75
6. degree 45, material ductile iron TOTAL 296.20 303.10 335.30 384.10 335.00 367.50
10ea. (SAWS #9630) UNIT
Bend, size 6" x 1/16, end type mechanical joint PRICE 27.20 27.44 30.79 35.28 31.12 33.75
7. degree 22-1/2, material ductile iron TOTAL 272.00 274.40 307.90 352.80 311.20 337.50
10ea. (SAWS #9631) UNIT
Bend, size 6" x 1/32, end type mechanical joint PRICE 28.11 28.35 31.82 36.46 32.70 34.87
8. degree 11-1/4, material ductile iron TOTAL 281.10 283.50 318.20 364.60 327.00 348.70
5 ea. (SAWS #9642) UNIT
Bend, size 6" x 1/4, end type mechanical X plain PRICE 44.13 39.97 41.40 57.23 41.40 54.75
9. degree 90, material ductile iron TOTAL 220.65 199.85 207.00 286.15 207.00 273.75
lea. (SAWS #9643) UNIT
Bend, size 6" x 1/8, end type mechanical X plain PRICE 32.95 32.37 32.85 42.73 37.30 40.88
10. degree 45, material ductile iron TOTAL 32.95 32.37 32.85 42.73 37.30 40.88
lea. (SAWS #9641) UNIT
Bend, size 6" x 1/16, end type mechanical X plain PRICE 34.46 29.73 30.31 44.68 39.00 42.75
11. degree 22-1/2, material ductile iron TOTAL 34.46 29.73 30.31 44.68 39.00 42.75
5ea. (SAWS #9636) UNIT
Bend, size 8" x 1/4, end type mechanical joint PRICE 53.20 54.43 59.27 68.98 60.10 66.00
12. degree 90, material ductile iron TOTAL 266.00 272.15 296.35 344.90 300.50 330.00
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10ea. (SAWS #9637) UNIT
Bend, size 8" x 1/8, end type mechanical joint PRICE 43.22 44.23 48.93 56.05 48.60 53.62
13. degree 45, material ductile iron TOTAL 432.20 442.30 489.30 560.50 486.00 536.20
5ea. (SAWS #9634) UNIT
Bend, size 8" x 1/16, end type mechanical joint PRICE 42.32 42.68 47.40 54.87 47.90 52.50
14, degree 22-1/2, material ductile iron TOTAL 211.60 213.40 237.00 274.35 239.50 262.50
5ea. (SAWS #9635) UNIT
Bend, size 8" x 1/32, end type mechanical joint PRICE 38.39 38.72 43.00 49.78 43.20 47.62
15. degree 11-1/4, material ductile iron TOTAL 191.95 193.60 215.00 248.90 216.00 238.10
5ea. (SAWS #9645) UNIT
Bend, size 8" x 1/4, end type mechanical X plain PRICE 63.17 58.13 59.58 81.92 75.30 78.37
16. degree 90, material ductile iron TOTAL 315.85 290.65 297.90 409.60 376.50 391.85
5ea. (SAWS #9646) UNIT
Bend, size 8" x 1/8, end type mechanical X plain PRICE 52.89 47.24 48.17 68.60 59.50 65.62
17. degree 45, material ductile iron TOTAL 264.45 236.20 240.85 343.00 297.50 328.10
2 ea. (SAWS #9644) UNIT
Bend, size 8" x 1/16, end type mechanical X plain PRICE 52.89 46.24 47.15 68.60 59.50 65.62
18. degree 22-1/2, material ductile iron TOTAL 105.78 92.48 94.30 137.20 119.00 131.24
5ea. (SAWS #9614) UNIT
Bend, size 10" x 1/4, end type mechanical joint PRICE 84.63 85.37 93.81 109.75 95.20 105.00
19. degree 90, material ductile iron TOTAL 423.15 426.85 469.05 548.75 476.00 525.00
5 ea. (SAWS #9615) UNIT
Bend, size 10" x 1/8, end type mechanical joint PRICE 63.17 63.72 70.03 81.92 71.40 78.37
20. degree 45, material ductile iron TOTAL 315.85 318.60 350.15 409.60 357.00 391.85
5ea. (SAWS #9613) UNIT
Bend, size 10" x 1/16, end type mechanical joint PRICE 62.87 63.41 69.69 81.53 71.10 78.00
21. degree 22-1/2, material ductile iron TOTAL 314.35 317.05 348.45 407.65 355.50 390.00
5ea. (SAWS #9617) UNIT
Bend, size 12" x 1/4, end type mechanical joint PRICE 113.95 116.60 128.98 147.77 128.90 141.37
22. degree 90, material ductile iron TOTAL 569.75 583.00 644.90 738.85 644.50 706.85
5ea. (SAWS #9618) UNIT
Bend, size 12" x 1/8, end type mechanical joint PRICE 94.30 96.49 106.74 122.29 106.10 117.00
23. degree 45, material ductile iron TOTAL 471.50 482.45 533.70 611.45 530.50 585.00
5ea. (SAWS #9619) UNIT
Bend, size 12" x 1/16, end type mechanical joint PRICE 82.52 83.23 93.40 107.00 93.30 102.37
24, degree 22-1/2, material ductile iron TOTAL 412.60 416.15 467.00 535.00 466.50 511.85
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5ea. (SAWS #9616) UNIT
Bend, size 12" x 1/32, end type mechanical joint PRICE 77.38 78.05 87.58 100.34 87.50 96.00
25. degree 11-1/4, material ductile iron TOTAL 386.90 390.25 437.90 501.70 437.50 480.00
5ea. (SAWS #9622) UNIT
Bend, size 16" x 1/4, end type mechanical joint PRICE 259.03 261.28 287.14 335.90 291.50 321.37
26. degree 90, material ductile iron TOTAL 1,295.15 1,306.40 1,435.70 1,679.50 1,457.50 1,606.85
5ea. (SAWS #9623) UNIT
Bend, size 16" x 1/8, end type mechanical joint PRICE 184.98 186.59 205.05 239.87 208.00 229.50
27. degree 45, material ductile iron TOTAL 924.90 932.95 1,025.25 1,199.35 1,040.00 1,147.50
5ea. (SAWS #9620) UNIT
Bend, size 16" x 1/16, end type mechanical joint PRICE 177.42 178.96 196.68 230.08 199.00 220.12
28. degree 22-1/2, material ductile iron TOTAL 887.10 894.80 983.40 1,150.40 995.00 1,100.60
5ea. (SAWS #9621) UNIT
Bend, size 16" x 1/32, end type mechanical joint PRICE 187.70 189.33 208.07 243.41 211.20 232.87
29. degree 11-1/4, material ductile iron TOTAL 938.50 946.65 1,040.35 1,217.05 1,056.00 1,164.35
1ea. (SAWS #9625) UNIT
Bend, size 20" x 1/8, end type mechanical joint PRICE 283.51 285.98 314.28 367.77 317.40 351.75
30. degree 45, material ductile iron TOTAL 283.51 285.98 314.28 367.77 317.40 351.75
5ea. (SAWS #9624) UNIT
Bend, size 20" x 1/16, end type mechanical joint PRICE 296.21 294.00 328.35 384.11 331.60 367.50
31. degree 22-1/2, material ductile iron TOTAL 1,481.05 1,470.00 1,641.75 1,920.55 1,658.00 1,837.50
1 ea. (SAWS #9638) UNIT
Bend, size 24", ACC end type mechanical joint PRICE 430.71 427.50 477.45 558.53 482.20 534.37
32. degree 45, material ductile iron TOTAL 430.71 427.50 477.45 558.53 482.20 534.37
5 ea. (SAWS #9639) UNIT
Bend, size 24", ACC end type mechanical joint PRICE 649.23 644.40 719.69 842.00 726.00 805.50
33. degree 90, material ductile iron TOTAL 3,246.15 3,222.00 3,598.45 4,210.00 3,630.00 4,027.50
15 ea. (SAWS #9640) UNIT
Bend, anchor, size 6 x 1/4, end type mechanical joint PRICE 70.43 72.06 79.72 91.33 79.20 87.37
34. degree 90, material ductile iron TOTAL 1,056.45 1,080.90 1,195.80 1,369.95 1,188.00 1,310.55
*
GROUP 1 TOTAL TOTAL 16,630.94 16,636.22 18,365.58 21,567.30 18,690.03 20,633.18
M. Star, Sigma
Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Part No. Star Tyler & SIP Sigma Tyler Union Serampre NACIP
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Group 2, FLG Bend
5 ea. (SAWS #9648) UNIT
Bend, size 3", end type flange, degree 90 material ductile PRICE 26.60 26.83 30.11 34.49 29.90 33.00
1. iron TOTAL 133.00 134.15 150.55 172.45 149.50 165.00
5 ea. (SAWS #9647) UNIT
Bend, size 4", end type flange, degree 90, material ductile PRICE 41.41 41.77 46.87 53.70 46.60 51.37
2. iron TOTAL 207.05 208.85 234.35 268.50 233.00 256.85
5 ea. (SAWS #31606) UNIT
Bend, size 6", end type flange, degree 90, material ductile PRICE 64.08 64.63 72.53 83.09 72.10 79.50
3. iron TOTAL 320.40 323.15 362.65 415.45 360.50 397.50
5 ea. (SAWS #9612) UNIT
Bend, size 8", end type flange, degree 90, material ductile PRICE 105.49 106.40 119.40 136.80 118.00 130.87
4. iron TOTAL 527.45 532.00 597.00 684.00 590.00 654.35
GROUP 2 TOTAL TOTAL 1,187.90 1,198.15 1,344.55 1,540.40 1,333.00 1,473.70
M. Star, Sigma
Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Part No. Star Tyler & SIP Sigma Tyler Union Serampore NACIP
GROUP 3, TEE ANCHOR & COUPLING ANCHOR
10 ea. (SAWS #16641) UNIT
Tee, anchor, size 6" x 6", end type mechanical joint PRICE 61.06 62.47 69.11 INCOMPLETE 68.70 75.75
1. material ductile iron TOTAL 610.60 624.70 691.10 687.00 757.50
10 ea. (SAWS #16643) UNIT
Tee, anchor, size 8" x 6", end type mechanical joint PRICE 76.47 78.25 86.56 INCOMPLETE 86.10 94.87
2. material ductile iron TOTAL 764.70 782.50 865.60 861.00 948.70
10 ea. (SAWS #16639) UNIT
Tee, anchor, size 12" x 6", end type mechanical joint PRICE 110.32 112.89 121.45 INCOMPLETE 124.80 136.87
3. material ductile iron TOTAL 1,103.20 1,128.90 1,214.50 1,248.00 1,368.70
5ea. (SAWS #16642) UNIT
Tee, anchor, size 8", end type mechanical joint PRICE 116.07 118.76 131.37 INCOMPLETE 130.60 144.00
4. material ductile iron TOTAL 580.35 593.80 656.85 653.00 720.00
5ea. (SAW #16640) UNIT
Tee, anchor, size 24" x 6", end type mechanical joint PRICE 490.55 486.90 461.24 INCOMPLETE 548.00 608.62
5. material ductile iron TOTAL 2,452.75 2,434.50 2,306.20 2,740.00 3,043.10
10 ea. (SAWS #11093) UNIT
Coupling, anchor, size 4" end type mechanical joint PRICE 33.87 34.15 37.53 INCOMPLETE 38.10 42.00
6. material ductile iron TOTAL 338.70 341.50 375.30 381.00 420.00
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50 ea. (SAWS #11094) UNIT
Coupling, anchor, size 6" end type mechanical joint PRICE 60.45 60.98 70.65 INCOMPLETE 68.00 82.50
7. material ductile iron TOTAL 3,022.50 3,049.00 3,5632.50 3,400.00 4,125.00
20 ea. (SAWS #11095) UNIT
Coupling, anchor, size 8", end type mechanical joint PRICE 77.38 78.05 90.44 INCOMPLETE 87.10 96.00
8. material ductile iron TOTAL 1,547.60 1,561.00 1,808.80 1,742.00 1,920.00
lea. (SAW #27514) UNIT
Coupling, anchor, size 12", end type mechanical joint PRICE 204.32 206.10 220.70 INCOMPLETE 229.90 253.50
9. material ductile iron TOTAL 204.32 206.10 220.70 229.90 253.50
*
INCOMPLETE
GROUP 3 TOTAL TOTAL 10,624.72 10,722.00 11,671.55 11,941.90 13,556.50
Mir. Star, Sigma
Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Part No. Star Tyler & SIP Sigma Serampore NACIP
Group 4, UNI-FLG Adapter
5 ea. (SAWS #9192) UNIT
Adapter, size 3", end type uni-flange, OD 3.96 PRICE 28.80 16.43 19.11 10.60 16.50 28.12
1. material ductile iron TOTAL 144.00 82.15 95.55 53.00 82.50 140.60
15 ea. (SAWS #9188) UNIT
Adapter, size 4", end type uni-flange, material ductile PRICE 30.45 22.13 26.38 18.00 22.22 36.37
2. iron TOTAL 456.75 331.95 395.70 270.00 333.30 545.55
10 ea. (SAWS #9186) UNIT
Adapter, size 6", end type uni-flange, material ductile PRICE 38.40 23.83 28.41 26.00 23.90 47.25
3. iron TOTAL 384.00 238.30 284.10 260.00 239.00 472.50
*
Group 4 Total TOTAL 984.75 652.40 775.35 583.00 654.80 1,158.65
Mfr. Star, Sigma
Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Part No. Star Tyler & SIP Sigma Tyler Union Serampore NACIP
Group 5, Tees & Cross
1lea. (SAWS #1584) UNIT
Tee, size 4" x 4", end type mechanical joint PRICE 29.32 29.57 3251 38.00 INCOMPLETE 36.50
1. material ductile iron TOTAL 29.32 29.57 32.51 38.00 36.50
5ea. (SAWS #16633) UNIT
Tee, size 4" x 6" end type mechanical joint PRICE 606.92 131.99 182.21 154.43 INCOMPLETE 230.00
2. material ductile iron TOTAL 3,034.60 659.95 911.05 772.15 1,150.00
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10 ea. (SAWS #16635) UNIT
Tee, size 6" x 4", end type mechanical joint PRICE 49.27 49.70 54.90 63.90 INCOMPLETE 61.12
3. material ductile iron TOTAL 492.70 497.00 549.00 639.00 611.20
10 ea. (SAWS #16634) UNIT
Tee, size 6" x 6", end type mechanical joint PRICE 52.90 54.12 59.87 68.60 INCOMPLETE 65.62
4. material ductile iron TOTAL 529.00 541.20 598.70 686.00 656.20
2 ea. (SAWS #16644) UNIT
Tee, size 6" x 8", end type mechanical joint PRICE 104.28 115.58 73.04 135.23 INCOMPLETE 175.00
5. material ductile iron, bullhead TOTAL 208.56 231.16 146.08 270.46 350.00
2 ea. (SAWS #16637) UNIT
Tee, size 8" x 4", end type mechanical joint PRICE 57.13 56.70 63.33 74.10 INCOMPLETE 70.87
6. material ductile iron TOTAL 114.26 113.40 126.66 148.20 141.74
10 ea. (SAWS #16638) UNIT
Tee, size 8" x 6", end type mechanical joint PRICE 65.89 67.42 75.37 85.45 INCOMPLETE 81.75
7. material ductile iron TOTAL 658.90 674.20 753.70 854.50 817.50
10 ea. (SAWS #16636) UNIT
Tee, size 8" x 8", end type mechanical joint PRICE 65.89 67.42 75.37 85.45 INCOMPLETE 98.62
8. material ductile iron TOTAL 658.90 674.20 753.70 854.50 986.20
lea. (SAWS #16621) UNIT
Tee, size 10" end type mechanical joint PRICE 113.65 114.63 124.69 147.37 INCOMPLETE 141.00
9. material ductile iron TOTAL 113.65 114.63 124.69 147.37 141.00
10 ea. (SAWS #16622) UNIT
Tee, size 10" x 6", end type mechanical joint PRICE 84.93 84.30 96.14 110.40 INCOMPLETE 105.37
10. material ductile iron TOTAL 849.30 843.00 961.40 1,104.00 1,053.70
1ea. (SAWS #16624) UNIT
Tee, size 12" x 4", end type mechanical joint PRICE 107.30 106.50 117.73 139.15 INCOMPLETE 133.12
11. material ductile iron TOTAL 107.30 106.50 117.73 139.15 133.12
10 ea. (SAWS #16625) UNIT
Tee, size 12" x 6", end type mechanical joint PRICE 107.30 109.79 122.75 139.15 INCOMPLETE 133.12
12, material ductile iron TOTAL 1,073.00 1,097.90 1,227.50 1,391.50 1,331.20
10 ea. (SAWS #16626) UNIT
Tee, size 12" x 8", end type mechanical joint PRICE 123.94 126.80 141.79 160.70 INCOMPLETE 153.75
13. material ductile iron TOTAL 1,239.40 1,268.00 1,417.90 1,607.00 1,537.50
5ea. (SAWS #16623) UNIT
Tee, size 12" x 12", end type mechanical joint PRICE 158.68 160.06 177.74 205.78 INCOMPLETE 196.87
14, material ductile iron TOTAL 793.40 800.30 888.70 1,028.90 984.35
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lea. (SAWS #16627) UNIT
Tee, size 16", end type mechancial joint PRICE 363.00 366.16 398.30 470.74 INCOMPLETE 450.37
15. material ductile iron TOTAL 363.00 366.16 398.30 470.74 450.37
lea. (SAWS #16629) UNIT
Tee, size 16" x 4", end type mechancial joint PRICE 500.00 439.40 448.37 529.92 INCOMPLETE 507.00
16. material ductile iron TOTAL 500.00 439.40 448.37 529.92 507.00
5ea. (SAWS #16630) UNIT
Tee, size 16" x 6", end type mechanical joint PRICE 221.55 219.90 255.10 287.30 INCOMPLETE 274.87
17. material ductile iron TOTAL 1,107.75 1,099.50 1,275.50 1,436.50 1,374.35
lea. (SAWS #16631) UNIT
Tee, size 16" x 8", end type mechanical joint, PRICE 240.59 238.80 271.43 312.00 INCOMPLETE 298.50
18. material ductile iron TOTAL 240.59 238.80 271.43 312.00 298.50
5ea. (SAWS #16628) UNIT
Tee, size 16" x 12", end type mechanical joint, PRICE 287.74 285.60 271.43 373.14 INCOMPLETE 357.00
19. material ductile iron TOTAL 1,438.70 1,428.00 1,357.15 1,865.70 1,785.00
UNIT
1 ea. (SAWS #16616) PRICE 75.57 77.32 83.76 98.00 INCOMPLETE 93.75
20. Tee, size 4", end type flange, material ductile iron TOTAL 75.57 77.32 83.76 98.00 93.75
UNIT
5 ea. (SAWS #16617) PRICE 94.30 96.49 104.54 122.30 INCOMPLETE 117.00
21. Tee, size 6", end type flange, material ductile iron TOTAL 471.50 482.45 522.70 611.50 585.00
UNIT
10 ea. (SAWS #16618) PRICE 157.47 161.13 178.24 204.21 INCOMPLETE 195.37
22. Tee, size 8", end type flange, material ductile iron TOTAL 1,574.70 1,611.30 1,782.40 2,042.10 1,953.70
UNIT
10 ea. (SAWS #16615) PRICE 348.19 356.29 394.11 451.53 INCOMPLETE 432.00
23. Tee, size 12", ent type flange, material ductile iron TOTAL 3,481.90 3,562.90 3,941.10 4,515.30 4,320.00
5 ea. (SAWS #16647) UNIT
Tee, tapped, size 6" x 2", end type mechanical joint, PRICE 44.44 44.82 49.51 57.62 INCOMPLETE 55.12
24, material ductile iron TOTAL 222.20 224.10 247.55 288.10 275.60
5 ea. (SAWS #16648) UNIT
Tee, tapped, size 8" x 2", end type mechanical joint PRICE 74.05 74.70 82.52 96.03 INCOMPLETE 91.87
25. material ductile iron TOTAL 370.25 373.50 412.60 480.15 459.35
5 ea. (SAWS #16645) UNIT
Tee, tapped, size 12" x 2", end type mechanical joint PRICE 200.09 201.85 222.95 259.47 INCOMPLETE 248.25
26. material ductile iron TOTAL 1,000.45 1,009.25 1,114.75 1,297.35 1,241.25
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5 ea. (SAWS #16646) UNIT
Tee, tapped, size 16" x 2", end type mechancial joint PRICE 216.21 217.99 237.12 280.25 INCOMPLETE 268.12
27. material ductile iron TOTAL 1,081.05 1,089.95 1,185.60 1,401.25 1,340.60
lea. (SAWS #11320) UNIT
Cross, size 8" x 6", end type mechanical joint PRICE 80.10 80.79 87.89 103.87 INCOMPLETE 99.37
28. material ductile iron, used for asbestos cement pipe TOTAL 80.10 80.79 87.89 103.87 99.37
5 ea. (SAWS #11306) UNIT
Cross, size 12" x 6", end type mechanical joint, PRICE 130.27 131.40 145.92 168.94 INCOMPLETE 161.62
29. material ductile iron, used for ashestos cement pipe TOTAL 651.35 657.00 729.60 844.70 808.10
1ea. (SAWS #27515) UNIT
Cross, size 12" x 8", end type mechanical joint PRICE 150.22 151.25 164.83 194.80 INCOMPLETE 186.37
30. material ductile iron, used for asbestos cement pipe TOTAL 150.22 151.25 164.83 194.80 186.37
lea (SAWS #11318) UNIT
Cross, size 6", end type mechanical joint PRICE 77.38 78.05 84.90 100.34 INCOMPLETE 96.00
31. material ductile iron TOTAL 77.38 78.05 84.90 100.34 96.00
lea. (SAWS #11319) UNIT
Cross, size 8", end type mechanical joint PRICE 84.33 85.06 92.53 109.36 INCOMPLETE 104.62
32. material ductile iron TOTAL 84.33 85.06 92.53 109.36 104.62
UNIT
1 ea. (SAWS #11317) PRICE 63.17 63.72 69.32 81.92 INCOMPLETE 78.37
33. Cross, size 4" end type flange, material ductile iron TOTAL 63.17 63.72 69.32 81.92 78.37
INCOMPLETE
Group 5 Total TOTAL 22,936.50 20,769.51 22,879.60 26,464.33 25,987.51
Mfr. Star, Sigma
Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Part No. Star Tyler & SIP Sigma Tyler Union NACIP
Group 6, MJ Caps & Plugs
10 ea. (SAWS #10229) UNIT
Cap, size 2", end type mechanical joint PRICE 17.22 11.40 17.18 20.00 17.40 19.12
1. material ductile iron TOTAL 172.20 114.00 171.80 200.00 174.00 191.20
lea. (SAWS #10231) UNIT
Cap, size 3", end type mechanical joint PRICE 7.86 7.93 8.76 10.20 8.80 9.75
2. material ductile iron TOTAL 7.86 7.93 8.76 10.20 8.80 9.75
15 ea. (SAWS #10232) UNIT
Cap, size 4", end type mechanical joint PRICE 8.17 8.23 9.15 10.60 9.20 10.12
3. material ductile iron TOTAL 122.55 123.45 137.25 159.00 138.00 151.80
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10 ea. (SAWS #10233) UNIT
Cap, size 6", end type mechanical joint PRICE 1451 14.63 16.25 18.80 16.30 18.00
4, material ductile iron TOTAL 145.10 146.30 162.50 188.00 163.00 180.00
10 ea. (SAWS #10234) UNIT
Cap, size 8", end type mechanical joint PRICE 24.18 24.39 35.46 31.36 27.20 30.00
5. material ductile iron TOTAL 241.80 243.90 354.60 313.60 272.00 300.00
10 ea. (SAWS #10226) UNIT
Cap, size 10", end type mechanical joint PRICE 30.53 30.30 34.02 39.60 34.30 37.87
6. material ductile iron TOTAL 305.30 303.00 340.20 396.00 343.00 378.70
10 ea. (SAWS #10227) UNIT
Cap, size 12", end type mechanical joint PRICE 45.64 45.30 50.86 59.20 51.40 56.62
7. material ductile iron TOTAL 456.40 453.00 508.60 592.00 514.00 566.20
5ea. (SAWS #10228) UNIT
Cap, size 16", end type mechanical joint PRICE 92.79 92.10 102.87 120.35 104.40 115.12
8. material ductile iron TOTAL 463.95 460.50 514.35 601.75 522.00 575.60
5ea. (SAWS #10230) UNIT
Cap, size 24", end type mechanical joint PRICE 201.30 199.88 233.14 261.00 226.50 249.75
9. material ductile iron TOTAL 1,006.50 999.40 1,165.70 1,305.00 1,132.50 1,248.75
1ea. (SAWS #10269) UNIT
Cap, size 3" x 2", end type mechanical joint PRICE 16.93 17.07 18.57 21.95 19.20 21.00
10. material ductile iron TOTAL 16.93 17.07 18.57 21.95 19.20 21.00
10 ea. (SAWS #10239) UNIT
Cap, size 4" x 2", end type mechanical joint PRICE 17.23 17.38 19.10 22.35 19.50 21.37
11, material ductile iron TOTAL 172.30 173.80 191.00 223.50 195.00 213.70
10 ea. (SAWS #10240) UNIT
Cap, size 6" x 2", end type mechanical joint PRICE 23.58 23.78 26.41 30.57 26.50 29.25
12. material ductile iron TOTAL 235.80 237.80 264.10 305.70 265.00 292.50
10 ea. (SAWS #10241) UNIT
Cap, size 8" x 2", end type mechanical joint PRICE 32.95 33.23 36.91 42.73 37.30 40.87
13. material ductile iron TOTAL 329.50 332.30 369.10 427.30 373.00 408.70
5ea. (SAWS #10201) UNIT
Cap, size 10" x 2", end type mechanical joint PRICE 39.30 39.63 43.11 51.00 44.20 48.75
14. material ductile iron TOTAL 196.50 198.15 215.55 255.00 221.00 243.75
2 ea. (SAWS #10238) UNIT
Cap, size 12" x 2", end type mechanical joint PRICE 54.71 55.18 61.28 71.00 61.60 67.87
15. material ductile iron TOTAL 109.42 110.36 122.56 142.00 123.20 135.74
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5ea. (SAWS #10237) UNIT
Cap, size 16" x 2", end type mecahnical joint PRICE 106.70 105.90 118.28 138.36 120.10 132.37
16. material ductile iron TOTAL 533.50 529.50 591.40 691.80 600.50 661.85
10 ea. (SAWS #10235) UNIT
Cap, eccentric, size 12" x 2", end type mechanical X tapped [PRICE 75.87 54.30 133.46 187.95 61.90 112.87
17. material ductile iron TOTAL 758.70 543.00 1,334.60 1,879.50 619.00 1,128.70
10 ea. (SAWS #10236) UNIT
Cap, eccentric, size 16" x 2", end type mechanical X tapped |PRICE 128.06 105.90 192.56 313.86 190.00 177.37
18. material ductile iron TOTAL 1,280.60 1,059.00 1,925.60 3,138.60 1,900.00 1,773.70
5ea. (SAWS #14933) UNIT
Plug, solid, size 4", end type mechanical joint PRICE 9.98 10.06 11.06 13.00 11.30 12.37
19. material ductile iron includes ears and bolts TOTAL 49.90 50.30 55.30 65.00 56.50 61.85
10 ea. (SAWS #14934) UNIT
Plug, solid, size 6", end type mechanical joint PRICE 19.35 19.51 21.44 25.00 22.00 24.00
20. material ductile iron includes ears and bolts TOTAL 193.50 195.10 214.40 250.00 220.00 240.00
10 ea. (SAWS #14935) UNIT
Plug, solid, size 8", end type mechanical joint PRICE 29.02 29.27 31.17 37.63 32.60 36.00
21. material ductile iron includes ears and bolts TOTAL 290.20 292.70 311.70 376.30 326.00 360.00
5ea. (SAWS #14928) UNIT
Plug, solid, size 10", end type mechanical joint PRICE 51.08 51.52 56.05 66.25 57.50 63.00
22. material ductile iron includes ears and bolts TOTAL 255.40 257.60 280.25 331.25 287.50 315.00
10 ea. (SAWS #14929) UNIT
Plug, solid, size 12", end type mechanical joint PRICE 50.18 50.61 55.62 65.06 59.75 73.12
23. material ductile iron includes ears and bolts TOTAL 501.80 506.10 556.20 650.60 597.50 731.20
5ea. (SAWS #14930) UNIT
Plug, solid, size 16", end type mechanical joint PRICE 132.99 134.15 148.96 172.46 149.60 182.62
24, material ductile iron, includes ears and bolts TOTAL 664.95 670.75 744.80 862.30 748.00 913.10
1ea. (SAWS #14931) UNIT
Plug, solid, size 20", end type mechanical joint PRICE 217.02 215.40 238.11 281.42 245.00 269.25
25. material ductile iron, includes ears and bolts TOTAL 217.02 215.40 238.11 281.42 245.00 269.25
1ea. (SAWS #14932) UNIT
Plug, solid, size 24", end type mechanical joint PRICE 301.05 298.80 330.31 390.40 338.70 373.50
26. material ductile iron includes ears and bolts TOTAL 301.05 298.80 330.31 390.40 338.70 373.50
1ea. (SAWS #15002) UNIT
Plug, tapping, size 3" x 2", end type mechanical joint PRICE 20.56 20.40 22.55 26.65 23.20 25.50
27. material ductile iron TOTAL 20.56 20.40 22.55 26.65 23.20 25.50
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5ea. (SAWS #14939) UNIT
Plug, tapping, size 4" x 2", end type mechanical joint PRICE 18.74 18.90 20.77 24.30 25.00 23.25
28. material ductile iron TOTAL 93.70 94.50 103.85 121.50 125.00 116.25
5ea. (SAWS #14940) UNIT
Plug, tapping, size 6" x 2", end type mechanical joint PRICE 28.11 28.35 31.16 36.46 31.60 34.87
29. material ductile iron TOTAL 140.55 141.75 155.80 182.30 158.00 174.35
10 ea. (SAWS 14941) UNIT
Plug, tapping, size 8" x 2", end type mechanical joint PRICE 37.79 38.11 42.10 49.00 42.50 46.87
30. material ductile iron TOTAL 377.90 381.10 421.00 490.00 425.00 468.70
5ea. (SAWS #14936) UNIT
Plug, tapping, size 10" x 2", end type mechanical joint PRICE 59.85 59.40 65.66 77.60 67.30 74.25
31. material ductile iron TOTAL 299.25 297.00 328.30 388.00 336.50 371.25
5ea. (SAWS 14937) UNIT
Plug, tapping, size 12" x 2", end type mechanical joint PRICE 58.94 59.45 65.01 76.44 66.30 73.12
32. material ductile iron TOTAL 294.70 297.25 325.05 382.20 331.50 365.60
1ea. (SAWS 14938) UNIT
Plug, tapping, size 16" x 2", end type mechanical joint PRICE 147.20 146.10 163.18 190.89 166.50 182.62
33. material ductile iron TOTAL 147.20 146.10 163.18 190.89 166.50 182.62
*
Group 6 Total TOTAL 10,402.59 9,917.31 12,647.04 15,839.71 11,968.10 13,449.81
Mfr. Star, Sigma
Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Part No. Star Tyler & SIP Sigma Tyler Union Serampore NACIP
Group 7, Offsets & Reducers
5ea. (SAWS #14403) UNIT
Offset, size 6" x 12, end type mechanical X plain PRICE 78.59 80.41 88.02 INCOMPLETE 170.20 97.50
1. material ductile iron TOTAL 392.95 402.05 440.10 851.00 487.50
2 ea. (SAWS #14404) UNIT
Offset, size 6" x 18", end type mechanical X plain PRICE 111.23 112.20 124.59 INCOMPLETE 196.60 138.00
2. material ductile iron TOTAL 222.46 224.40 249.18 393.20 276.00
5 ea. (SAWS #14405) UNIT
Offset, size 8" x 12", end type mechanical X plain PRICE 127.25 128.35 142.53 INCOMPLETE 268.00 157.87
3. material ductile iron TOTAL 636.25 641.75 712.65 1,340.00 789.35
2 ea. (SAWS #14406) UNIT
Offset, size 8" x 18", end type mechanical X plain PRICE 143.57 144.82 160.82 INCOMPLETE 538.00 178.12
4. material ductile iron TOTAL 287.14 289.64 321.64 1,076.00 356.24
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5ea. (SAWS #14401) UNIT
Offset, size 12" x 12", end type mechanical X plain PRICE 229.11 231.10 256.61 INCOMPLETE 1,017.50 284.25
5. material ductile iron TOTAL 1,145.55 1,155.50 1,283.05 5,087.50 1,421.25
5ea. (SAWS #14402) UNIT
Offset, size 12" x 18", end type mechanical X plain PRICE 312.23 309.90 349.72 INCOMPLETE 1,191.00 387.37
6. material ductile iron TOTAL 1,561.15 1,549.50 1,748.60 5,955.00 1,936.85
2 ea. (SAWS #151309) UNIT
Reducer, size 4" x 3", end type mechanical joint PRICE 18.74 18.90 21.21 INCOMPLETE 28.90 23.25
7. material ductile iron TOTAL 37.48 37.80 42.42 57.80 46.50
5 ea. (SAWS #15129) UNIT
Reducer, size 4" x 3", end type flange, PRICE 28.11 28.47 31.82 INCOMPLETE 32.80 34.87
8. material ductile iron TOTAL 140.55 142.35 159.10 164.00 174.35
5ea. (SAWS #15140) UNIT
Reducer, size 6" x 4", end type mechanical joint PRICE 21.16 31.16 28.48 INCOMPLETE 24.00 26.25
9. material ductile iron TOTAL 105.80 155.80 142.40 120.00 131.25
UNIT
5 ea. (SAWS #15146) PRICE 25.70 21.34 28.48 INCOMPLETE 29.20 31.87
10. Reducer, size 6" x 4", end type PE, material ductile iron TOTAL 128.50 106.70 142.40 146.00 159.35
5 ea. (SAWS #15141) UNIT
Reducer, size 8" x 4", end type mechanical joint PRICE 29.02 25.91 32.84 INCOMPLETE 33.20 36.00
11. material ductile iron TOTAL 145.10 129.55 164.20 166.00 180.00
5 ea. (SAWS #15142) UNIT
Reducer, size 8" x 6", end type mechanical joint PRICE 30.83 31.71 34.56 INCOMPLETE 34.90 38.25
12, material ductile iron TOTAL 154.15 158.55 172.80 174.50 191.25
2 ea. (SAWS #15143) UNIT
Reducer, size 8" x 6", end type mechanical X plain PRICE 33.25 31.10 66.33 INCOMPLETE 45.80 41.25
13. material ductile iron TOTAL 66.50 62.20 132.66 91.60 82.50
1ea. (SAWS #15130) UNIT
Reducer, size 10" x 8", end type mechanical joint PRICE 43.83 32.83 48.59 INCOMPLETE 49.60 54.37
14, material ductile iron TOTAL 43.83 32.83 48.59 49.60 54.37
5ea. (SAWS #15132) UNIT
Reducer, size 12" x 4", end type mechanical joint PRICE 60.45 43.50 67.01 INCOMPLETE 68.40 75.00
15. material ductile iron TOTAL 302.25 217.50 335.05 342.00 375.00
2 ea. (SAWS #15133) UNIT
Reducer, size 12" x 6", end type mechanical joint PRICE 52.60 60.98 59.53 INCOMPLETE 59.50 65.25
16. material ductile iron TOTAL 105.20 121.96 119.06 119.00 130.50
2 ea. (SAWS #15134) UNIT
Reducer, size 12" x 8", end type mechanical joint PRICE 54.11 53.05 61.24 INCOMPLETE 61.20 67.12
17. material ductile iron TOTAL 108.22 106.10 122.48 122.40 134.24
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lea. (SAWS #15131) UNIT
Reducer, size 12" x 10", end type mechanical joint PRICE 59.85 59.40 66.34 INCOMPLETE 67.70 74.25
18. material ductile iron TOTAL 59.85 59.40 66.34 67.70 74.25
1 ea. (SAWS #15137) UNIT
Reducer, size 16" x 6", end type mechanical joint PRICE 137.23 136.20 152.11 INCOMPLETE 154.40 170.25
19. material ductile iron TOTAL 137.23 136.20 152.11 154.40 170.25
1lea. (SAWS #15138) UNIT
Reducer, size 16" x 8", end type mechanical joint PRICE 132.09 131.10 146.42 INCOMPLETE 158.80 163.87
20. material ductile iron TOTAL 132.09 131.10 146.42 158.80 163.87
5ea. (SAWS #15135) UNIT
Reducer, size 16" x 10", end type mechanical joint PRICE 127.25 126.30 141.06 INCOMPLETE 143.90 157.87
21. material ductile iron TOTAL 636.25 631.50 705.30 719.50 789.35
1lea. (SAWS #15136) UNIT
Reducer, size 16" x 12", end type mechanical joint PRICE 122.72 121.80 136.03 INCOMPLETE 139.00 152.25
22. material ductile iron TOTAL 122.72 121.80 136.03 139.00 152.25
5ea. (SAWS #15144) UNIT
Reducer, eccentric, size 6" x 2", end type mechanical X PRICE 435.00 423.33 358.97 INCOMPLETE 441.83 415.00
23. threaded, material ductile iron TOTAL 2,175.00 2,116.65 1,794.85 2,209.15 2,075.00
5ea. (SAWS #15145) UNIT
Reducer, eccentric, size 8" x 2", end type mechanical X PRICE 640.00 592.52 512.82 INCOMPLETE 609.65 575.00
24, threaded, material ductile iron TOTAL 3,200.00 2,962.60 2,564.10 3,048.25 2,875.00
INCOMPLETE
Group 7 Total TOTAL 12,046.22 11,693.43 11,901.53 22,752.40 13,226.47
Mfr. Star, Sigma
Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Part No. Tyler & SIP Sigma Serampore NACIP
Group 8, Nipples
5 ea. (SAWS #14099) UNIT
Nipple, size 4" x 15", end type flange, material ductile PRICE 100.60 92.95 96.27 NO BID 101.60 141.25
1. iron TOTAL 503.00 464.75 481.35 508.00 706.25
5 ea. (SAWS #14100) UNIT
Nipple, size 4" x 24", end type flange, material ductile PRICE 110.30 101.93 105.58 NO BID 111.40 155.00
2. iron TOTAL 551.50 509.65 527.90 557.00 775.00
10 ea. (SAWS #14106) UNIT
Nipple, size 4" x 120", end type flange, material ductile PRICE 265.90 245.67 254.46 NO BID 268.60 373.75
3. iron TOTAL 2,659.00 2,456.70 2,544.60 2,686.00 3,737.50
5 ea. (SAWS #14109) UNIT
Nipple, size 6" x 12", end type flange, material ductile PRICE 115.55 106.77 110.59 NO BID 116.70 162.50
4, iron TOTAL 577.75 533.85 552.95 583.50 812.50
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5 ea. (SAWS #14101) UNIT
Nipple, size 6" x 13 1/2", end type flange, material PRICE 127.50 117.83 122.04 NO BID 128.80 180.00
5. ductile iron TOTAL 637.50 589.15 610.20 644.00 900.00
1 ea. (SAWS #14102) UNIT
Nipple, size 6" x 18", end type flange, material ductile PRICE 127.50 117.83 122.04 NO BID 128.80 180.00
6. iron TOTAL 127.50 117.83 122.04 128.80 180.00
1 ea. (SAWS #14103) UNIT
Nipple, size 6" x 24", end type flange, material ductile PRICE 139.50 128.88 133.49 NO BID 140.90 196.25
7. iron TOTAL 139.50 128.88 133.49 140.90 196.25
10 ea. (SAWS #14096) UNIT
Nipple, size 6" x 132", end type flange, material ductile PRICE 354.90 327.91 339.64 NO BID 358.50 498.75
8. iron TOTAL 3,549.00 3,279.10 3,396.40 3,585.00 4,987.50
2 ea. (SAWS #14110) UNIT
Nipple, size 8" x 12 1/2", end type flange, material PRICE 186.60 172.42 178.59 NO BID 188.50 262.50
9. ductile iron TOTAL 373.20 344.84 357.18 377.00 525.00
5 ea. (SAWS #14104) UNIT
Nipple, size 8" x 24", end type flange, material ductile PRICE 203.05 187.62 194.34 NO BID 205.10 286.25
10. iron TOTAL 1,015.25 938.10 971.70 1,025.50 1,431.25
1 ea. (SAWS #14097) UNIT
Nipple, size 8" x 138", end type flange, material ductile PRICE 515.70 476.48 493.54 NO BID 521.00 725.00
11. iron TOTAL 515.70 476.48 493.54 521.00 725.00
1 ea. (SAWS #14108) UNIT
Nipple, size 4" x 30 1/2", end type flange x PE, material PRICE 93.10 86.04 89.12 NO BID 94.10 131.25
12. ductile iron TOTAL 93.10 86.04 89.12 94.10 131.25
1 ea. (SAWS #14114) UNIT
Nipple, size 6" x 26", end type flange x PE, material PRICE 103.60 95.71 99.14 NO BID 104.60 146.25
13. ductile iron TOTAL 103.60 95.71 99.14 104.60 146.25
5 ea. (SAWS #14113) UNIT
Nipple, size 8" x 16 1/2", end type flange x PE, material PRICE 114.80 106.08 109.87 NO BID 116.00 161.25
14. ductile iron TOTAL 574.00 530.40 549.35 580.00 806.25
1 ea. (SAWS #14111) UNIT
Nipple, size 8' x 23 1/2", end type flange x PE, material PRICE 131.25 121.28 125.62 NO BID 132.60 185.00
15. ductile iron TOTAL 131.25 121.28 125.62 132.60 185.00
5 ea. (SAWS #14115) UNIT
Nipple, size 6" x 48" x end type MJ anchor, material PRICE 303.60 276.00 248.00 NO BID 306.70 300.00
16. ductile iron TOTAL 1,518.00 1,380.00 1,240.00 1,533.50 1,500.00
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F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)
SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM 3
P. O. BOX 2449 2 o j o ® o g >
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 ) N % Q o2 © by § §
TABULATION OF BIDS <E( R 2gR sAoR - R 7:5 R n
S x g e x s =X = .3 S 2 X %= 5
PROPOSAL s gc'__ %E"__ EUC); n & %§§
FOR: Annual Contract for Ductile Iron MJ Compact Fitting s 2 >332 =52 g g - 2 gn 2 >3 ~
TIME & (June 1, 2017 through May 31, 2018) 2SS g §§ = 82 83 E 882 g3 X
DATE: 3:00 p.m., April 13, 2017 = o < n &< 2~ < o > a5 < ERNIP
SR~ O0® 8 59 8 4 8 S S 898
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY L oo 0 I awm L < 0 Y m X < < U < — X
5 ea. (SAWS #14116) UNIT
Nipple, size 8" x 48", end type MJ anchor, material PRICE 399.85 363.50 276.00 NO BID 403.90 390.00
17. ductile iron TOTAL 1,999.25 1,817.50 1,380.00 2,019.50 1,950.00
*
NO BID
Group 8 Total TOTAL 15,068.10 13,870.26 13,674.58 15,221.00 19,695.00
Mfr. US Pipe
Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Part No. Custom Fab Custom Fab Custom Fab & Foundry Metro-Tex
AWARD TOTAL 43,511.66 56,250.51 13,674.58 583.00
EXTENSION 1 43,511.66 56,250.51 13,674.58 583.00
EXTENSION 2 43,511.66 56,250.51 13,674.58 583.00
EXTENSION 3 43,511.66 56,250.51 13,674.58 583.00
Net Net Net 2% Net Net
Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days 15 days 30 days 30 days
Delivery Days
* LOW BIDDER
BID INVITATIONS E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:
Accurate Meter Supply Gajeske Demandstar
ACT Pipe & Supply HD Supply SAWS Website
AY McDonald Hydropro Solutions
Cohen Pipe KLP Commercial
Corix Milford Online
Ferguson Waterworks MS Techline Pipe

Fortiline
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